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A Message From The Chancellor 

I have had the opportunity to attend two functions of 
the Afro-American Student Organization in their 
recognition of Black History Month at Coastal 
Carolina College. The programs have been excellent 
and well planned; however, the most recent one, 
while an excellent program. suffered from lack of 
audience participation. I know that all of you are 
committed to our A/ firmative Action goals and 
recognize the importance of our rein/ orcing the 
efforts of all student groups, but. especially the 
minority student groups and, there/ ore, I am asking 
each of you to participate in the two remaining 
programs and encourage students to participate as 
well. 

We must provide opportunity and recog111t1on for 
our minority students. Nothing helps this goal 
more than our involvement and giving of our time; 
there/ ore, I hope each one of you will join me in 
attendance at the next two events so that we can all 
learn from and support these fine young people. 

Dr. Ron Eaglin 

Afro-Am History Month Programs 

Citizens Forum - Friday, February 19 at 7 p.m. in 
Wheelwright Auditorium. 

The theme "This Land Is Our Land Too" will be 
moderated by Jerilyn Gaghum, counselor, Conway 
High School-. Speakers will be as follows: 

Business: 

Medical: 

Legal Services: 
(Law) 

Mr. John Montague, Mgr. 
Sears Roebuck, Inc. 
Myrtle Beach, S. C. 

Dr. Jeanne Laird Halyard 
Horry Medical Center 
Conway, S. C. 

Jennifer P. Williams, 
Attorney at Law 
Horry County, S. C. 

USC COAST AL CAROLINA COLLEGE 
Office of Public Relations, PO Box 1954, Conway, SC 29526 

Education: 

Finance: 

Leroy Rainbow, Principal 
Myrtle Beach H. S. 
Myrtle Beach, S. C. 

Pat 0. Baten, Branch Mgr. 
C & S National Bank 
Conway, S. C. 

A reception will follow on the Wheelwright 
Mezzanine. 

Salute to Education - Monday, February 29 at 7 
p.m. in Wheelwright Auditorium. 

The keynote speaker will be Ruby Forsythe, whose 
teaching career spans more than 60 years. She now 
has 67 children (ages 6 to 9) in her one room school 
in Pawleys Island, where she is the only teacher. 

Preston L. McKever-Floyd, professor of philosophy 
and religion, will present a dramatic reading of 
Martin Luther King, Jr's famous speech, "I have a 
Dream." 

Afro-Am students will present a skit. 

Music will be provided by Hilda McKiever, media 
specialist from Aynor High School, with 
accompanist, Leslie Mciver, band director from 
Conway High School. 

Chancellor Eaglin will present awards to selected 
retired educators. 

A reception will follow on the Wheelwright 
Mezzanine. 

For information, contact George Williams, Sr., ext. 
2304. 

Aids Information Update Scheduled 

The Office of Medical Referral and Health 
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Information will sponsor an Aids Information 
Update on February 17 at 1:30 p.m. in SC-205. 

Cheryl Adamson, MPH, director of Aids Education 
and the State Department of Health and Environmental 
Control, will be the main speaker. 

This program is free and open to the public. For 
information contact Tom Wiemken, ext. 2327 or Dr. 
Joe Mazurkiewicz, ext. 2305 or 2315. 

Faculty House Festivities 

Faculty House members are invited for pizza on 
Thursday, February 18. 

Festivities will begin at 4:30 p.m. for pizza and will 
be capped off by the Chants vs. East Tennessee 
State basketball game at 7:30 p.m. 

New members are always welcome. For 
membership information, contact Jack Kendree, 
ext. 2659. 

Ecumenical Service of Prayer 
Scheduled 

An ecumenical service of prayer with imposition of 
ashes will be held Wednesday, February 17, at 12:30 
p.m. in SC-205. 

Ash Wednesday speaker will be The Right 
Reverend F. C. James, presiding bishop of S. C. 
(AME). 

Special music will be presented by the Coastal 
Concert Choir, accompanied by DeeAnne Smith. 

For more information, contact Dr. Robert 
Robinson, ext. 2436. 

Core Curriculum Committee Proposal 
Distributed 

The Core Curriculum Committee has finalized its 
proposal of a core curriculum for the College. This 
proposal is being submitted to the Academic Affairs 
Committee for consideration at its February 24 
meeting. 

Copies of the proposal are being distributed to all 
faculty who hold rank at the College in order that 
each faculty member may become familiar with the 
proposal. If you have not received a copy at this 
time, contact Mary Bull, ext. 2404 or Beth -Haynes, 
ext. 2648. 

Alpha Kappa ~lpha Sorority Sponsors 
Black History Month Program 

In honor of Black History Month, the members of 
Alpha Kappa Alpha Sorority will sponsor a 
program on Thursday, February 18 at Cherry Hill 
Missionary Baptist Church in Conway at 7 p.m. 

The guest speaker is Nelson Rivers III, executive 
secretary of the S. C. Conference of the NAACP. 

Music will be provided by the Cheerileers of 
Cherry Hill Missionary Baptist Church. 

The public is cordially invited to attend. For more 
information, contact Lisa Evans, 626-8345 after 4 
p.m., or Carolyn Hickman, ext. 2024. 

Distinguished Teacher Nominations 
Accepted 

Nominations for Coastal's Distinguished Teacher 
Award for the academfo year 1987-88 will be 
accepted until February 29. 

A written statement must be submitted to the SGA 
president containing the person's name and 
supporting information concerning recommendation 
for this honor. 

Nominations may be made by any student currently 
enrolled or by any member of the faculty. 

For further information, contact Richard Weldon, 
SGA president, ext. 2641. 

"Hawaii" Slide Presentation Scheduled 

The Society of the Undersea World will sponsor a 
slide presentation entitled "Hawaii" on February 18, 
at I 1 :30 a.m. in the Science Building, room 110. 

Dr. Douglas Nelson, professor of marine science 
and geology, will make the presentation. 

Faculty, staff and students are invited and may 
bring their lunch, if desired. 

For information, contact Dr. Nelson, ext. 2217. 

Racquetball Tournament 

The Physical Education Center announces its 
Second Annual Racquetball Tournament to be held 
the weekend of February 26 through 28 in the P.E. 
Center. 

Competition will be divided into men's and 
women's groups in open, intermediate and beginner 
categories. A wards will be presented to winners 
and runners-up. 



I 
• Ali. entries must be received by Friday, February 
19, at 12 noon. The tournament format will be 
posted on Wednesday, February 24. Players are 
responsible for obtaining their starting times from 
the posted format. 

Entry forms are available at the P. E. Center front 
desk. For additional information, contact the P. E. 
Center, ext. 2800. 

Fanny and Alexander To Be Presented 

Coastal Film Society will present Fanny and 
Alexander directed by Ingmar Bergman, on 
Sunday, F~bruary 21 at 2 p.m. and 7:30 p.m., in the 
Fine Arts Little Theatre. 

Bergman's self proclaimed "final" film is the story 
of the year in the life of two children, Fanny and 
Alexander Eckdahl. This 1983 film is a glorious 
summation of Bergman's career, where anger is 
balanced out by the joy of living and love. It is in 
Swedish with English subtitles. 

Tickets are $2, and are available at the door. 

Office of Continuing Education 
Courses Offered 

The Office of Continuing Education is offering the 
following courses: 

Our Beach and Environment 

February 16, 2 to 5 p.m. at Cherokee Motor Inn, 
Myrtle Beach. Fee: $5 per person or $7 for two. 

Taking the Mystery Out of Computers 

I session, Saturday, 9 a.m. to 4 p.m., AC-208. 
February 20 or March 19. Instructor: Linda 
Kuykendall. Fee: $125. 

For information, contact the Office of Continuing 
Education, ext. 2676. 

Coastal Participates In 
Carolina Woman's Show 

Coastal will have a booth at the Carolina Woman's 
Show on Saturday, March 12 and Sunday, March 13 
at the Myrtle Beach Convention Center. 

Robert Elvington is seeking several volunteers to 
help at the booth for two-hour intervals during the 
scheduled days of the show. 

Faculty and staff are preferred for booth duties, 
which include giving out information concerning 
Coastal and its programs. 

The show times are Saturday from 10 a.m. until 7 
p.m., and Sunday from noon until 5:30 p.m. 

For more information or to volunteer, contact 
Robert Elvington, ext. 2673. 

Children's Art Activities Planned 

Children's Art Activities will be a six-week 
adventure each Wednesday afternoon from March 
23 through April 27, from 3:45 p.m. until 5 p.m., 
in the Fine Arts Building. 

Class activities, taught by art education students, 
include T-shirt painting, underwater drawings, 
imaginary animal sculptures,. bubble murals, and 
character stories. 

Children must be between 6 and 12 years of age to 
register. Enrollment will be limited to 25 children. 
There will be a $ I 5 fee for supplies. 

For further information, or to register, contact 
Shirrell Mishoe, ext. 2702. 

Walt Disne_y World 
Internship Program 

A representative of Walt Disney World will be on 
campus interviewing students for both the summer 
and fall I 988 Internship Programs at Walt Disney 
World on Monday, February 22, beginning at 8:30 
a.m. in SC-204. 

Students chosen by Walt Disney World can earn six 
hours of credit through the Business Administration 
497 - Internship at Coastal. Additional hours may 
be earned through the University of Central Florida 
in Orlando while working at WOW. A 15 page 
paper is required for the course. 

Three IO-hour seminars, which will be attended by 
each student as part of their work experience, are 
offered by WOW as part of their college program. 
The courses include: 

Disney University 
Guest Relations 
Food and Beverage 
Employee Relations 
Entertainment 

Marketing 
Merchandising 
Finance 
Resorts 
Career Planning 

While at WOW, students have an opportunity to 
work in these areas: resorts, merchandising, and 
attractions. 

Applicants must be at least a sophomore with a 
minimum 2.75 GPR. Business, physical education, 
and communications majors are welcomed. 

Each student is paid $4.65 per hour, and housing is 



provided at $50 a week. 

For additional information, contact Ed Cerny, ext. 
2651. 

Health Tips To Be Broadcast Daily 

The Physical Education Center and WJYR Radio 
are broadcasting "Health Tips" at 8 a.m. each day, 
before the morning news, as a Public Service. 

Be sure to listen and start the day in a healthy and 
positive way! 

Coastal Carolina People 

o Dr. Elizabeth Puskar, dean of the School of 
Natural and Applied Sciences, recently received an 
award recogmzmg the accomplishments of 
University Women throughout the system. Awards 
were presented at a banquet honoring the 
contributions made by women. Dr. Puskar's award 
was given in the area of administration. 

o Dr. Susan Libes, assistant professor of marine 
science, recently had accepted for publication a 
research article entitled "The Isotope Geochemistry 
of Particulate Nitrogen in the Peru Upwelling Area 
and the Gulf of Maine." The work will appear in 
the prestigious oceanographic research journal, 
Deep-Sea Research. 

o Dr. Paul T. Gayes, assistant professor of marine 
science and geology, recently presented an invited 
lecture at the Marine Sciences Research Center of 
the State University of New York, entitled "The 
Geological History and Ultimate Fate of the Long 
Island Sound Estuary." While in New York he also 
attended a meeting of the New York Academy of 
Sciences in Manhattan. 

Classifieds 

FOR SALE: Three piece sectional sofa. Call 347-
4342, after 5:30 p.m. 

Campus Calendar 

February 15: 

Founder's Dav. 2:30 p.m., WA. 

Women's Basketball, Coastal vs. Furman, 7 p.m., 
away. 

February 17: 

Ecumenical Service of Prayer, 12:30 p.m., SC-205. 

Aids Information Update, J :30 p.m., SC-205. 

Women's Basketball, Coastal vs. Virginia 
Commonwealth, 7 p.m .. home. 

Baseball, Coastal vs. The Citadel, 3 p.m., home. 

February 18: 

Faculty House Pizza, 4:30 p.m., Faculty House. 

"Hawaii" Slide Presentation, JJ :30 a.m., Science 
110. 

Men's Basketball. Coastal vs. East Tennessee, 7:30 
p.m .. home. 

February 19: 

A fro-American Students Citizens Forum, 7 p.m., 
WA. 

Classroom 88 Conference, 3 p.m., WA. 

Men's Tennis, Coastal vs. North Greenville, 1 p.m., 
home. 

February 20: 

Classroom 88 Conference, beginning 7:30 a.m., WA. 

Women's Basketball, Coastal vs. Campbell, 5 p.m., 
home. 

Men's Basketball, Coastal vs. Augusta, 7:30 p.m., 
home. 

February 21: 

Sunday Chapel, 10:30 a.m., SC-205. 

Fanny and Alexander, Coastal Film Society, 2 and 
7:30 p.m., FALT. 

Baseball. Coastal vs. UNC-Charlotte, 2 p.m., home. 

February 22: 

Women's Basketball, Coastal vs. Ga. Tech, 7:30 p.m., 
away. 

Men's Basketball, Coastal vs. East Tennessee, 7:30 
p.m. away. 

Baseball, Coastal vs. UNC-Charlotte, 2 p.m., away. 
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