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DEPENDENTS' SCHOLARSHIP 

The Faculty/Staff Dependents' Scholarship 
application deadline is Feb. 15. The scholar­
ship is open to any dependent or spouse of 
a full-time slotted University of South Caro­
lina system employee. To be eligible, appli­
cants must be enrolled, or accepted for en­
rollment, as a full-time undergraduate, gra­
duate, or professional student on one of the 
university's nine campuses and predict, or 
have attained, a minimum 3.0 Grade Point 
Average. The scholarship is renewable for up 
to four years for students pursuing baccalau­
reate degrees, provided the recipient main­
tains a 3.0 GPR. For applications, write: 
University of South Carolina-Columbia, Of­
fice of Student Financial Aid and Scholar­
ships, 1714 College Street, Columbia, SC 
29208. 

BUILDING TEMPERATURE 

To evaluate and adjust the college's HY AC 
systems, a comfort range has been established. 
During the heating season, the average tempe­
rature should fall within the 66-71 F. degree 
range, with exception of the Library Building. 
If your office or classroom does not fall 
within the specified range, please complete a 
Maintenance Service request form stating the 
room and approximate temperature, adjust­
ments will be made as quickly as possible. A 
portion of the newly renovated offices does 
not have HY AC supplied heat. These offices 
may need to be heated by portable heaters. 
However, South Carolina Fire code prohibits 
the use of portable heaters in state buildings. 
All faculty and staff who have HY AC access 
are requested to remove all portable heaters 
as soon as possible. 

USC-COASTAL CAROLINA COLLEGE 

THANK YOU 

The Security Department would like to ex­
tend its appreciation and thanks to all facul­
ty and staff members for cooperation over 
the Thanksgiving holidays. The department 
hopes everyone's needs were met and your 
continued assistance will enable the depart­
ment to fulfill your requirements. 

PDK CHRISTMAS SOCIAL 

Phi Delta Kappa Professional Education Fra­
ternity will have a Christmas Social Oyster 
Roast at the Fireman's Clubhouse, Conway 
Marina, on Dec. 13. 

AUDITIONS 

Auditions for the Arthur Miller play, All My 
Sons, will be held from 3:30-6:30 p.m. Dec. 
5-6 in the Little Theatre of the Fine Arts 
Building. David E. Majewski will direct the 
production with a cast of five men and four 
women. The characters range in age from the 
rnid-20s to the early 60s. There is also a need 
for one small male between the ages of 9 and 
13 to portray the paper boy. 

BASKETBALL TOURNEY 

The Coastal Carolina Intramural Department 
will sponsor a "One On One Basketball Tour­
nament" at 1:30 p.m., Dec. 5 in the gym. 
Students and faculty are invited to participate 
in competition. Sign-up deadline is today in 
the gym or Student Center. 

Thi, Week is published by U.S.C. Coastal Carolina College, 
an equal opportunity employer subscribing to all Civil Rights 
legislation. 



ART SHOW, SALE AND RECEPTION 

Coastal Carolina College Art Club is sponso­
ring an art show Wednesday, Dec. 5-Friday, 
Dec. 7 in the Fine Arts Building. A recep­
tion will be held at I :30 p.m. Wednesday and 
there will be a departmental sale throughout 
the show. 

FACULTY HOUSE 

A Faculty House pre-game social is from 5-
7:30 p.m. Dec. 4. Free hot dogs and bevera­
rages will be provided for members. Guests 
will be charged for re freshmen ts. 

FACULTY /STUDENT STUDY ABROAD 

Several opportunities to study or lecture 
abroad are available and may be arranged by 
contacting Bruno Gujer, Office of Interna­
tional Programs, in EMS 233-B. The opportu­
nities include: 
-Summer traineeships abroad for students in 

engineering, mathematics, and the sciences. 
-Internships in Scandinavia for juniors in 

business, computer science and engineering 
are available through the America-Scandina­
via Foundation. 

-Work and study Japanese while living in 
Japan through a U.S.-Japan Cross Culture 
Center scholarship. 

-Lecturing positions abroad are available for 
1985-86 from the Council for International 
Exchange of Scholars. These Fulbright 
grants include positions in American litera­
ture, history and culture. 

ONCE UPON A MATTRESS 

The musical comedy, Once Upon A Mattress, 
will be performed Dec. 7-9 in Wheelwright 
Performing Arts Center. The play, directed 
by Jay Thompson, is based upon the fairy 
tale, "The Princess and the Pea." Thompson 
was one of the co-authors of the play that was 
a Broadway hit starring Carol Burnett in her 
first major role. The college is presenting 
Once Upon A Mattress during its 25th anni­
versary year of its run on Broadway. Miss 
Burnett recently hosted an anniversary party 
for cast and creators of the show, which 
Thompson attended. 

OPEN ENROLLMENT FOR DENT AL 
COVERAGE TO CLOSE 

Open enrollment for dental coverage will 
close Dec. 15. If coverage is desired for 
spouse only, children only, or full family, the 
employee must sign a notice of election. If 
employee only coverage is desired, no action 
is required. For details, come to the Person­
nel Office in room 121 of the Singleton buil­
ding. 

AUGUST AND DECEMBER GRADUATES 

A cocktail reception honoring August 1984 
and December 1984 graduates will be held 
Dec. 6 from 7-9 p.m. in Wheelwright Audito­
rium Mezzanine. Invitations have been 
mailed. 

GEORGETOWN EXTENSION 

The Coastal Carolina College extension in 
Georgetown will have an Open House recep­
tion from 6:30-8:30 p.m., Friday, Dec. 7 at 
3 21 Cleland Stret. Invitations have been 
mailed. 

HOLIDAY PARTY 

¥ The annual holiday party will be held from 
6:30-11 p.m. Dec. 14 in the Student Center. 
More information about the event will be dis­
tributed later. Faculty and staff members are 
asked to reserve this date. Spouses and dates 
are invited. 

CORRECTION 

One phone ex tension listed on the Holiday 
Party invitations is incorrect. The correct 
extensions to RSVP by Dec. 7 are: 2421 
and 2621. 

GOLF TOURNAMENT IS SATURDAY 

The Coastal Educational Foundation, Inc. 
Golf Tournament, featuring former New 
York Yankee Manager Billy Martin, will be 
held Saturday, Dec. 8 at Myrtle Beach 
National Golf Course. The tourney will 
begin at 11 a.m. and the day will close with a 
barbecue. The fee is $35. For information 
about the tournament, contact Nadine God­
win at 448-148 I, 34 7-3 I 61 or 546-0234 at 
ext. 2014. 



ASSISTANCE TO NEEDY 

Faculty, students, clubs and athletic teams 
are asked to donate food to fill baskets that 
will be distributed to families needing assis­
tance during the holiday season. Canned or 
boxed goods are requested. Boxes will be 
placed in buildings throughout the campus 
for people wishing to donate. 

CHRISTMAS CONCERTS 

The Coastal Carolina College Choir will per­
form at 6:45 p.m. Dec. 5 under the clock at 
Myrtle Square Mall. Also, community-wide 
service will be held in Wheelwright Performing 
Arts Center at 7:30 p.m. Dec. 10 This will 
feature the Coastal Carolina chorus and the 
Community Chorus. Carolyn Cox will direct 
Coastal's chorus, and Tom Smith will direct 
the Community Chorus. 

MESSAGE FROM CHANCELLOR HICKS 

"On the 26th, we had 94 percent partici­
pation in our 1984 Family Fund Campaign. 
To all of you, please let me extend my gra­
titude for your support of the United Way, 
the loyalty fund of the University, and the 
Coastal Educational Foundation. Particular­
ly, I thank Ed Cerny and each of his division 
captains for their hard work and efforts on 
behalf of all of us." 

MEDIA CENTER HAS WAITING LINE 

The end of the semester is here and the Media 
Center is piled up with projects, so it has set 
up a waiting line. Please bring your projects 
in at least two weeks in advance in order to 
give time for typesetting, lay-out, editing, 
proofing and printing. 
Presently, there is a waiting list and your 
name will be added to it when you bring your 
project in. 

FACULTY /STAFF 

(a) Pat Bennett, School of Nursing, was guest 
speaker at Brunswick Technical College on 
Nov. 19. Ms. Bennett's topic was the utiliza­
tion of the IBM Personal Computer in the 
School of Nursing and to what extent Coastal 
Carolina College uses its computers. 

(b) Steve Nagle presented a paper, "Toward 
Comprehensive Model-Building in Second 
Language Acquisition," at SECOL XXXI, 
during the Fall 1984 meeting of the South­
eastern Conference on Linguistics in Atlanta 
on Nov. 9. 

(c) Ballou Skinner appeared on WMYB's 
Doug Hiatt Show on Nov. 20 and discussed 
the role of the Horry County Literacy Coun­
cil in combatting illiteracy in Horry County. 
Dr. Skinner is a member of the board of direc­
tors of the council. 

(d) David E. Majewski and the cast and crew 
of Seascape recently returned from Spartan­
burg where they performed their production 
as part of the American College Theatre Festi­
val XVII/South Carolina Theatre Association 
Conference. The cast received a favorable 
critique from the ACTF adjudicators, Majews­
ki said. They competed against such schools 
as Clemson University, Furman University 
and the University of South Carolina. This 
was the first time the college was in the Ame­
rican College Theatre Festival. 

(e) Thomas E. Jones, chairman of the Depart­
ament of Theatre and Speech in the School of 
Humanities, recently spoke to the men of 
Murrells Inlet Presbyterian Church. His topic 
was the state of the arts on the Grand Strand, 
during which he gave an overview of the many 
arts programs available in both Horry and 
Georgetown counties. Also at the meeting, 
Jones announced that the upcoming produc­
tion of Mark Medoffs Children Of A Lesser 
God will be at Wheelwright Performing Arts 
Center on Jan. 22. It is sponsored by the 
Grand Strand Theater Series. 

(f) Dr. James March, assistant professor of 
piano, and his wife, Kathryn L!,lcas March, 
adjund professor of piano, performed as a 
duo team in the "Performing Artist's Show­
case," Sunday, Dec. 2 at the Dock Street 
Theatre in Charleston. The Showcase was 
sponsored by the South Carolina Arts Coun­
cil. The March duo also has been funded to 
participate in the Arts Council's "Communi­
ty Tour Program." 
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CALENDAR OF EVENTS 

Monday, Dec. 3 
- Sales Seminar, 11 a.m., SC 205 
- SGA meeting, 1:30 p.m., SC-204 
- ODK, 2:30 p.m., SC-204 
- College After 25, 5 p.m., upstairs, Student 

Center. 

Tuesday, Dec. 4 
- Panel of Presidents meeting, 8 a.m. SC-107 

Wednesday, Dec. 5 
- Coastal Carolina College Art Club recep­

tion, show and sale, l :30 p.m., Fine Arts 
Building. 

Thursday, Dec. 6 
- APO meeting, l p.m., SC-204 
- A:Ydobon Society, 7 p.m., SC-205 
- APO Pledge Meeting, 11:30 a.m., SC-201 

Friday, Dec. 7 
- Coastal Carolina Theatre, 4 p.m., SC­

overflow 
- Once Upon A Mattress. 8 p.m., Wheel­

wright. Tickets $5. 

Saturday, Dec. 8 
- Coastal Educational Foundation, Inc. Golf 

Tournament featuring former New York 
Yankee Manager Billy Martin, l l a.m., 
Myrtle Beach National Golf Course, barbe­
cue dinner follows. 

- Ski Club party, 7 p.m., SC-205 
- Once Upon A Mattress, 8 p.m., Wheel-

wright, Tickets $5. 
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Sunday, Dec. 9 
- Once Upon A Mattress, 2:30 p.m., Wheel­

wright, Tickets $5. 
- Dr. Bob Robinson will speak at the 10:30 

a.m. service in the college chapel, upstairs, 
upstairs in the Student Union. 
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